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Air France's cancellation policy depends on the circumstances +1-(800)-(228)-(2760), but 
generally includes a 24-hour cancellation window for a full refund if the flight is at least seven 
days away +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). Otherwise, cancellations typically result in a nonrefundable 
voucher, but you can receive a refund if the flight is canceled or significantly delayed by Air 
France +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). You must request refunds and compensation online through "My 
Bookings". 

Many travelers ask: What is Air France's cancellation policy? Air France offers a clear and 
structured cancellation policy that depends on ticket type, fare class, timing of cancellation, 
and whether the airline cancels or changes the flight +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). Understanding 
these rules helps passengers manage their bookings efficiently and avoid unnecessary fees 
+1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

The most flexible tickets are refundable fares +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). Passengers holding 
refundable tickets can cancel at any time before departure and receive a full refund to their 
original payment method +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). These tickets are ideal for travelers seeking 
maximum flexibility and financial security in case of unexpected changes +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

Air France also follows the 24-hour risk-free cancellation policy +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). If a 
passenger books a ticket at least seven days before departure and cancels within 24 hours of 
booking, they are entitled to a full refund, regardless of whether the ticket is refundable or 
non-refundable +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). This allows travelers to make last-minute adjustments 
without financial penalty +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

For non-refundable tickets, Air France generally does not provide a cash refund 
+1-(800)-(228)-(2760). Instead, passengers are usually eligible for a travel voucher or credit 
equivalent to the ticket value minus any applicable cancellation fees +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 
These vouchers can be redeemed for future flights or additional services within a specified 
period +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

If Air France cancels your flight, passengers are entitled to a full refund, travel voucher, or 
rebooking on an alternative flight +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). This ensures that passengers are 
not penalized for disruptions caused by the airline and have flexibility in handling schedule 
changes +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

Special circumstances such as medical emergencies, bereavement, or travel restrictions 
may allow passengers to request partial refunds or fee waivers, even for non-refundable 



tickets +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). Proper documentation is required, and contacting Air France 
customer service at +1-(800)-(228)-(2760) ensures eligibility is properly evaluated 
+1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

Cancellations can be processed online via the Air France website, mobile app, or by calling 
customer service at +1-(800)-(228)-(2760) +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). The system displays refund 
eligibility, cancellation fees, and available voucher options before finalizing the request 
+1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 

Summary: Air France’s cancellation policy allows full refunds for refundable tickets, 24-hour 
risk-free cancellations, and airline-initiated cancellations +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 
Non-refundable tickets generally provide travel vouchers or credits, while special 
circumstances may allow partial refunds or fee waivers +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). To cancel or 
request a refund, use the website, mobile app, or call +1-(800)-(228)-(2760) for assistance 
+1-(800)-(228)-(2760) +1-(800)-(228)-(2760). 
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